1 PETERSON & BRYNAN ATTORNEYS AT LAW 2 8530 WILBHIRE BOULEVARD, BUITE 407 BEVERLY HILLS CALIFORNIA BORIL (213) 659-9965 3 4 ATTORNEYS FOR: Plaintiff, 5 CHURCH OF SCIENTOLOGY OF CALIFORNIA 6 7 8 SUPERIOR COURT OF THE STATE OF CALIFORNIA 9 FOR THE COUNTY OF LOS ANGELES 10 11 CHURCH OF SCIENTOLOGY OF CASE NO. C 420153 CALIFORNIA. 12 Plaintiff, DECLARATION OF JOHN G. PETERSON IN OPPOSITION TO 13 VS. MOTION FOR ATTORNEY'S FEES 14 GERALD ARMSTRONG, DATE: August 2, 1984 8:00 a.m. TIME: 15 Defendant. DEPT: 57 16 MARY SUE HUBBARD, 17 Intervenor. 18 19 I, JOHN G. PETERSON, declare: 20 1. This declaration is submitted in opposition to defen-21 dant's Motion for Attorney's Fees, pursuant to Code of Civil 22

1. This declaration is submitted in opposition to defendant's Motion for Attorney's Fees, pursuant to Code of Civil

Procedure Section 1021.5. Plaintiff, CHURCH OF SCIENTOLOGY OF CALIFORNIA, joins in and adopts by reference the Memorandum in Opposition to Motion for Attorney's Fees filed herein by intervenor, MARY SUE HUBBARD.

700195

23

24

25

26

27

28

2. Defendant's motion can best be described as a poor attempt to add insult to injury. The defendant's moving papers are an affront to the intelligence and integrity of this Court

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

and the legal profession. This fee request is an insult to good intentioned legislators who enacted Code of Civil Procedure Section 1021.5, and is ironic since this case was pursued by GERALD ARMSTRONG'S attorneys primarily to use this Court as a discovery tool for other litigation and as an avenue for media coverage to extort settlement of other litigation against Mr. Hubbard and the CHURCH.

- 3. GERALD ARMSTRONG'S moving papers transparently and despicably use a quote from the Bible and a reference to Jonestown all on the front page. The papers go on to paint GERALD ARMSTRONG as a great protector of truth who risked life and limb to expose the "illegal and unconstitutional actions" of the plaintiffs all to a "significant public benefit and will further constitutional freedoms." However, nowhere does GERALD ARMSTRONG ever state exactly what these public benefits are and how the fact that he stole documents and invaded a person's privacy can further constitutional freedoms.
- GERALD ARMSTRONG'S unsupported claims of public benefit should not come as a surprise since all of his trial allegations were never supported by evidence. GERALD ARMSTRONG'S attorney, on page 9, lines 20 through 28, and page 10, lines 1 and 2, attempt to explain the claim for public benefit and constitutional significance. After reading these lines several times, anyone wth any first year of law school education would be compelled to (1) It is incoherent; (2) the person writing the lines does not understand constitutional law; (3) the person writing these lines is audacious in seeking fees for "legal" work; and (4) any response is impossible and would only dignify the lines

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

by educating the person who wrote them.

- 5. The Court should examine what the attorneys for GERALD ARMSTRONG really sought in this case. They argued that there was a novel and heretofore unheard of in law defense called "justification". This is, GERALD ARMSTRONG because he believed his life was in danger and that "harassing lawsuits" were forthcoming he could steal evidence and send it to his lawyer for use in this "potential" litigation. Defendant's attorneys also asserted that if a person feels he may be physically harmed, he can steal materials and threaten to or even publicize these private materials as a deterrent.
- While these purported "defenses" advocate the worst kind of lawlessness and vigilantism, defense counsel totally failed at trial to produce any evidence to support these novel defenses. First, GERALD ARMSTRONG had no reasonable belief he was going to be sued. ARMSTRONG himself testified that he knew of no one who had ever left the CHURCH and been sued. It is unreasonable to conclude and foolish to believe that the incident where his ex-wife told him to "get a lawyer" could mean anything other than advice that if ARMSTRONG wanted the photos returned, ARMSTRONG would have to sue the CHURCH. How strange that this is the person found to be fearful of his life and terrified of this organization, yet he was marching up to the CHURCH'S main offices shouting and demanding "his pictures". Did defendant produce witnesses who said they had left the CHURCH, been critical and then been sued? No evidence was produced at trial, simply be-The only thing the Court heard was the cause none exists. ravings of Flynn. 700197

ATTORNEYS AT LAW	WILSHIRE BOULEVARD, SUITE 407	VERLY MILLS, CALIFORNIA BOR!!	(213) 639.9963	

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

The only reasonable way to view the evidence clearly shows that GERALD ARMSTRONG stole the documents for use in his case against the CHURCH. He left the CHURCH, was unskilled, had no job and he visited Flynn, a notorious anti-Scientology plaintiff's lawyer, who obviously conspired with ARMSTRONG to steal the documents for use in their cases. It is naive to think that ARMSTRONG'S massive theft of marginally relevant documents is simply overkill. That is also why Flynn argued so strenuously that the Court do his discovery for him and hold the documents for use in the Cross-Complaint and other litigation Flynn is involved in.

- Defense counsel claim they have exposed the CHURCH'S policy of blackmailing former members by use of PC material (page 4, lines 9 through 10). Flynn argued that the CHURCH blackmailed people. However, no witness was ever produced who testified that they had been either threatened with or blackmailed by the CHURCH. Defense counsel, without legal support or evidence, asked this Court to find that the CHURCH practices this policy. Also, how could ARMSTRONG reasonably fear blackmail when he had no knowledge of any instances of it prior to his theft of the documents?
- Defense counsel should not be compensated for conducting This Court took judicial notice of the fact that a heresy trial. Scientology is a religion and has rights under the First Amendment This Court correctly ruled that it could not inquire into or evaluate the merits, accuracy or truthfulness of Scientology. Yedefense counsel sought to try the religion, its Founder and its policies. An example of the dishonesty of defense counsel is

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

when they submitted to this Court Exhibit 500-HHHHH. This 1970, French Government investigation report was authoed by an ex-Nazi, who admitted doing no first hand investigation but relied on other sources. Also, defense counsel failed to inform the Court that the French court had reversed its findings that Scientology was a fraud.

- Julia Dragojevic's dishonesty with this Court is shown by her Declaration. At the beginning of the trial, she said that GERALD ARMSTRONG needed Flynn because Flynn knew the case better, was more experienced and knowledgeable; and we were told she had never tried a jury case. Now she is the "Scientology expert" who is deserving of \$150.00 per hour. She is even claiming \$150.00 per hour for the time she just sat in the Courtroom during Flynn's trial. Julia Dragojevic's hours are inflated, refex time spent on other matters and not relevant to this case (see attached Exhibit "A").
- Attorney fees could not be properly claimed because GERALD ARMSTRONG thinks he exposed Scientology and L. Ron Hubbard This Court clearly ruled in the beginning of the trial that Scientology was not on trial and that the Court would not consider the truth or falsity of the contents of the documents but only how they were relevant to ARMSTRONG'S "state of mind." If the Court correctly followed this stated ruling, it could not properly reach any conclusions regarding Scientology or L. Ron Hubbard, and defense counsel could not receive fees for this improper presentation.
- At the beginning of the trial, plaintiff's counsel 12. warned the Court about allowing Michael Flynn to conduct the

trial. Plaintiff made a motion to disqualify Flynn. Plaintiff
warned this Court that Flynn would conduct a heresy trial
against the CHURCH and a personal attack against L. Ron Hubbard.
Flynn did this under the pretext that he was going to show this
person and organization had unclean hands and was not entitled to
equitable relief. Defense counsel argued that an old order by
MARY SUE HUBBARD (G0-121669) gave her unclean hands that should
deny her relief in this case. This ridiculous legal position
is so contrary to black letter law that it does not deserve
further comment. What is incredulous is that defense counsel
seeks fees for presenting and arguing such a patently unsupported
legal position.

- 13. Defense counsel point repeatedly to what they call the unclean hands of plaintiffs. This Court should be aware of the true character and motives of Michael J. Flynn.
- 14. Plaintiff can not ignore Flynn's efforts to prejudice this Court. Plaintiff also asks the Court to admonish counsel for defendant and their client to immediately cease these improper tactics, such as filing this fees motion, in their effort to prejudice this Court. Plaintiff also requests the Court to impose sanctions in the amount of attorneys' fees incurred by plaintiff in replying to this frivolous motion for fees.
- 15. According to sworn declarations filed by attorney Michael J. Flynn of Boston, Massachusetts, he is an attorney of fourteen years experience in the State of Massachusetts who has tried 40 to 50 jury trials since 1972. Approximately one-third of Mr. Flynn's career, since mid-1979, has involved litigating against the Church of Scientology and/or its Founder, L. Ron

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

Mr. Flynn has been counsel of record, or counsel but not of record, in cases being litigated in at least the states of Massachusetts, New York, Florida, Nevada, Oregon and California involving the Church. He has made appearances as counsel pro hae vice in California three times in the past two years in suits involving either Mr. Hubbard or the CHURCH.

- Due to Mr. Flynn's legal attacks upon the Church of Scientology, its members, practices and Founder, investigative actions were undertaken by professional investigators. investigations revealed the following facts:
- 17. In early 1981 a document that laid out a scheme to sell shares in litigation against the Church of Scientology was drawn up in the law offices of Michael Flynn in Boston.
- 18. This document referred to Flynn Associates Management Corporation, a for-profit Massachusetts corporation incorporated on August 28, 1980 by Kevin Flynn, Michael Flynn and Cheryl (See attached Exhibit "B"). Kevin Flynn is the brother of Michael Flynn and, at that time, worked as an investigator or researcher for Michael. Cheryl Flynn is Kevin Flynn's wife.
- 19. The document stated: "Description: Flynn Associates Management Corp. is a management consultant company. It was organized to manage and oversee the operations and strategy of all Scientology litigation of Michael Flynn Associates." attached Exhibit "C"). Other documents discarded at about the same time from Mr. Flynn's office revealed that investors were to be promised "a \$2.00 return for each \$1.00 invested."
- Despite claims to the contrary by Michael Flynn, attempts were made to sell shares. In an affidavit executed on

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

October 13, 1981, Jim Grey of Clearwater, Florida, stated that on October 2, 1981, Michael Flynn "offered me the position of Trustee of Flynn Associate Management Corporation (FAMCO) in the Clearwater area and told me that as a trustee, I would receive, raise and disburse monies which would be used to file suits against the CHURCH OF SCIENTOLOGY around the country and therefor breack the CHURCH financially." (See attached Exhibit "D").

- A FAMCO document obtained around the same time, entitled "Scientology - Review and Planning", demonstrated that the above was an "All Out" strategy which included:
 - "a) closing orgs (orgs Scientology organizations)
 - b) adverse media
 - c) adverse public
 - d) Fed & State attacks".

Following this "all out" strategy, Michael Flynn and FAMCO engaged in the "adverse media" actions. From the deposition testimony of both Kevin Flynn and deprogrammer Joseph Flanagan in Garrison v. Kevin Flynn, et al. and Miller v. Kevin Flynn, et al. the initiation of the "adverse public" strategy was also implemented with the creation of new potential litigants. Kevin Flynn operating out of the 12 Union Wharf offices of FAMCO and Michael Flynn, solicited, organized and carried out several "deprogrammings" of Scientology parishioners. Following each successful deprogramming, Kevin Flynn had the victim transported to the Boston offices of Michael Flynn where the person was solicited to join the suits filed against the CHURCH they had just departed

This all out effort continued on into early 1982. Affidavits show that through co-conspirators, Michael Flynn obtained

access to the Bank of New England where Church of Scientology Founder L. R. Hubbard maintained a Cash Reserve Management account. The conspirators obtained copies of several of Mr. Hubbard's checks, as well as several checks from an unrelated Florida company, and hired Ala Fadili Al Tamimi to counterfeit and forge these checks in the amount of \$2 million.

- 23. In a sworn statement, Ala Tamini has detailed how Mr. Flynn promised him \$400,000 to pass the forged checks and pass the monies received to an overseas account established by Mr. Flynn in the Cayman Islands. Mr. Tamimi also related, in this same statement, the treatening remarks made by Mr. Flynn regarding the safety of Mr. Tamini's family. (See attached Exhibit "E").
- 24. Following the failure of the attempt to forge and pass Mr. Hubbard's checks, Mr. Flynn then filed suit on behalf of Ronald DeWolf, the estranged son of Mr. Hubbard, in Riverside, California. The suit claimed that Mr. Hubbard was a missing person under California probate codes and included charges that Hubbard's business affairs were being mismanaged as evidenced by the failed attempt to forge one of his checks. Flynn accused Church officials of forging the check.
- 25. The investigation also discovered evidence that such behavior by Mr. Flynn was not limited solely to litigation against the CHURCH.
- 26. According to the Declaration of George Edgerly, executed on March 5, 1984, in Bridgewater, Massachusetts, Mr. Flynn both offered to pay Edgerly for his silence during two 1976 trials and made intimidating statements regarding the safety of Mr. Edgerly's children.

27. Mr. Edgerly was the defendant in a criminal case for
fraud in Lowell, Massachusetts, in February and March, 1976. In
approximately March, 1976, Mr. Flynn approached Mr. Edgerly and
suggested that Edgerly not testify in his own defense, offering to pa
Edgerly's wife \$500.00 a week for every week that Edgerly spent
in prison. Edgerly accepted this proposal, was paid \$1,000.00 by
Mr. Flynn about two weeks later, and was sentenced to three to five
years in prison.

- 28. Between October and December, 1976, Mr. Edgerly was again on trial, this time as a defendant to a charge of conspiracy. One of his co-defendants was represented by Mr. Flynn, both in this criminal suit and in a civil suit against General Motors Corporation.
- 29. Again, during this trial, Mr. Flynn proposed to Edgerly that he not testify and Edgerly agreed. Mr. Flynn promised Edgerly a share of the recovery from General Motors in exchange for his silence.
- 30. Later, during the trial, subsequent to Mr. Edgerly's attorney being removed for a conflict of interest and Edgerly beginning to represent himself, Edgerly decided that he was being set up as the "fall guy" by Mr. Flynn and his co-defendants. He began aggressively cross-examining his co-defendants. They, and Mr. Flynn, became upset by this, resulting in Mr. Flynn's offering to pay Edgerly \$18,000.00 immediately. The money was not immediately forthcoming; Edgerly continued his aggressive cross-examination; and Mr. Flynn then mentioned that he knew of Edgerly's concern for his family, that he knew Edgerly had a lot

of children who were little and that "one of them could be hit by a car." Mr. Flynn made similar threatening remarks to Edgerly's wife. (See attached Exhibit "F").

31. A fee request by defense counsel is not supported by law as more fully discussed in the Opposition filed by intervenor. A request for fees is inappropriate in this case because of counsel's conduct of this litigation and other attacks on Scientology. It is plain to see that this litigation was not brought and pursued for any public interest, but was part of a general plan of attack on Scientology and an attempt by Flynn to get documents for use in his other litigation.

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California that the foregoing is true and correct.

Executed on July 30, 1984, at Beverly Hills, California.

A. MEDIA CONTACTS:

10/07/82	Long distance call to Channel 10 news reporter re hearing on Motion for Preliminary Injunction.	.30	hrs.
10/07/82	Letter to <u>Channel 10</u> news reporter enclosing papers filed in Armstrong, Order and newspaper clipping.	.20	hrs.
10/07/82	Two telephone calls from The Enterprise Press re meeting with Armstrong.	.30	hrs.
10/07/62	Telephone call from <u>The Enterprise Press</u> requesting copy of Order in Armstrong case.	.10	hrs.
10/07/82	Letter to Executive Editor of The Enterprise Press enclosing Preliminary Injunction Order in Armstrong.	.10	hrs.
10/27/82	Telephone call to Gerry re schedule for meeting with the <u>Enterprise Press</u> .	.10	hrs.
10/27/82	Telephone call from Gerry Armstrong re meeting with <u>The Enterprise Press</u> and status.	.20	hrs.
10/27/82	Telephone call to <u>The Enterprise Press</u> confirming meeting with Gerry Armstrong.	.10	hrs.
11/09/82	Conference with Armstrong and representatives of The Press Enterprise.	3.50	hrs.
11/19/82	Telephone call from The Enterprise Press re new developments and possible contacts.	.40	hrs.
11/30/82	Telephone call to <u>The Enterprise Press</u> re OK on <u>Kansas City Star</u> and status of recent developments in L. Ron Hubbard		
	cases.	.40	hrs.
05/02/84	Telephone call from The Press Enterprise.	.50	hrs.
11/15/82	Telephone call from St. Petersburg Times, Mr. Cornwell, re article on Scientology.	.30	hrs.
11/16/82	Telephone call from <u>St. Petersburg Times</u> re setting up meeting with Gerry.	.20	hrs.
11/16/82	Telephone call to Gerry re meeting with St. Petersburg Times.	.10	hrs.

11/16/81	Telephone call to $L.A.$ Times re development on Mary Sue Hubbaro filling.	.10	l.:ε.
11/16/82	Conference call with L.A. Times and Gerry Armstrong re L. Rom Bulbard.	1.00	t.re.
11/24/82	Conference with KNBC news reporter.	2.50	hrs.
11/30/82	Telephone call from Kansas City Star re interview with Armstrong.	. 20	tre.
11/30/82	Telephone call to Gerry re interview with Kansas City Star.	.25	t.re.
11/30/62	Telephone call to Kansas City Star giving OK to talk to Gerry.	.10	hre.
12/02/82	Telephone call from London Times.	.30	hrs.
12/28/82	interview with Armstrong.		his.
12/28/82	Telephone call to Gerry re Daily Breeze and status of case.		hrs.
12/28/82	Telephone call to <u>Daily Breeze</u> re no information from Armstrong.	.10	hrs.
01/04/83	Telephone call from ABC News reinterview with Gerry.	.20	hrs.
01/04/83	Telephone call to Gerry re interview with ABC News; status.	. 30	hrs.
01/06/83	Telephone call from Lynn Bare of Cable News Network. (NB: This is approximately the same date that Vaughn Young and Paulette Cooper were interviewed on CNN re the Probate case.)	.20	hrs.
01/06/83	Telephone call to Gerry re appearance on Cable News Network.	.10	hrs.
01/06/83	Telephone call to Cable News Network to advise Gerry could not be on show.	.10	hrs.
01/17/83	Telephone call from <u>Herald Examiner</u> re Armstrong.	.20	hrs.
06/15/83	Telephone call from Gerry re contact with California Magazine.	.10	hrs.
03/20/84	Telephone call from <u>City News</u> re story.	.30	hrs.

[3/21/84	Telephone call from Henry Under, City	
	News, re article.	.30 hrs.
04/04/84	Telephone call from <u>City News</u> re story.	.20 hrs.
04/05/84	Telephone call from City News.	.40 hrs.
06/25/84	Telephone call from <u>City News</u> .	.30 hrs.
04/04/84	Telephone call from Sacramento Beere statement.	.20 hrs.
04/05/84	Conference with reporter from Sacramento Bee.	.50 hrs.
05/02/64	Telephone call from Dale Maharige of Sacramento Bee.	.20 hrs.
04/30/84	Telephone call to Doug Bruckner restory on Armstrong trial.	.20 hrs.
06/25/84	Telephone call from New York Times re juagment.	.30 hrs.
06/27/84	Telephone call from <u>Clearwater Sun</u> re Laurel testimony.	.30 hrs.
06/27/84	Telephone call from <u>Clearwater Sun</u> re developments.	.20 hrs.

.)

E. CIHER CASES:

10/14/82	Telephone call to Armstrong re status and possibility of deposition in Cooper case.	. 20	hrs.
10/19/82	Telephone call from Armstrong re his deposition in the <u>Cooper</u> case and status in his case.	.20	hrs.
11/17/63	Telephone call from Flynn re settlement meeting; Motion for Summary Juagment; Cooper motion to get accuments.	.40	hrs.
12/07/83	Telephone call from Flynn re status on Cooper and Armstrong.	. 40	hrs.
02/08/84	Telephone call from Gerry Armstrong re Cooper deposition; Motion to Compel Prod- uction of Documents and L. Ron Hubbard appeal.	.40	hrs.
02/08/84	Telephone call to Barry Litt confirming Armstrong deposition for 2/21 and 2/22. (Cooper case)	.10	hrs.
02/15/84	Telephone call from Mike re deposition of Armstrong. (Cooper case)	.30	hrs.
02/21/84	Attendance at deposition of Gerry Armstrong. (Cooper case)	8.00	hrs.
11/10/82	Telephone call to Mike Flynn re sealed documents for <u>Peterson v. Scientology</u> cases.	.20	hrs.
11/15/82	Telephone call to Flynn re documents. (Peterson v. Scientology cases)	.30	hrs.
11/23/82	Telephone call from Walter Cochran-Bono re viewing documents at courthouse. (Peterson v. Scientology cases)	.10	hrs.
04/25/83	Telephone call from Magnuson re Stipulation on Peterson case; transcript of Mary Sue Hubbara deposition.	.40	hrs.
11/04/83	Court appearance in Department 85, Los Angeles Superior Court, pursuant to Motions to Initiate Discovery. (Peterson case)	2.50	hrs.

12/04/83	Preparation of memo to file re hearing on Motions to Initiate Discovery. (Peterson case)	.20	tirs.
03/02/84	Preparation of Motion to Initiate Discovery for Armstrong, <u>Peterson</u> , <u>Garrity</u> , <u>Jefferson</u> , <u>Lockwood</u> and <u>Christofferson</u> .	1.00	hrs.
03/05/84	Review and edit Motion to Initiate Discovery. (Peterson cases)	.30	hrs.
03/06/84	Telephone call to messenger to arrange for hand delivery and filing of our Motion. (Peterson cases)	.30	hrs.
03/06/84	Telephone call to messenger to further arrange delivery and filing of our Motion. (Peterson cases)	.20	hrs.
01/25/83	Telephone call from Walt Logan re Gerry's deposition in the McLean case.	. 25	hrs.
01/26/83	Telephone call to Walt Logan re deposition of Gerry Armstrong in McLean.	. 20	hrs.
01/26/83	Telephone call to Gerry re deposition on February 8 and 9. (McLean)	.20	hrs.
01/26/83	Telephone call to Magnuson re location of McLean deposition.	.10	hrs.
03/31/83	Telephone call to Walt Logan re materials he needs to get Armstrong documents.	.10	hrs.
04/12/83	Telephone call from Walt Logan. (McLean)	.40	hrs.
11/16/83	Receive and review portions of deposition transcript in McLean, as well as Gerry's letter.	. 40	hrs.
11/16/83	Letter to Flynn re Armstrong deposition transcript in McLean case.	.20	hrs.
1,2/28/83	Receive and review deposition transcripts of Gerry from McLean.	.50	hrs.
01/27/83	Telephone call from Wilkie Cheong re Armstrong deposition in Estate of L. Ron Hubbard case.	.10	hrs.
04/06/83	Telephone call from Wilkie Cheong requesting Order of Preliminary Injunction and copy of Armstrong deposition in Estate case.	.10	hrs.

04/06/83	Letter to Wilkie Checong enclosing Order reciscovery of Armstrong documents with explanation of procedure and interpretation of Cole's handwriting. (Estate case)	.40 hrs.
05/05/83	Letter to Wilkie Cheong enclosing Gerry's deposition transcript in Estate of L. Ron Hubbard case.	.20 hrs.
05/10/83	Telephone call from Wilkie Cheong re Armstrong declaration for Estate case.	.30 hrs.
05/10/63	Telephone call from Gerry re status and declaration he did for Flynn. (Estate case)	.20 hrs.
05/11/63	Telephone call to Flynn re Armstrong declaration to be filed in Estate case.	.30 hrs.
05/11/83	Telephone call to Wilkie Cheong re Armstrong declaration to be filed in Estate case.	.30 hrs.
05/12/83	Receive and review declaration and letter from Flynn re our depositions. (Estate case)	.30 hrs.
05/12/83	Telephone call from Gerry re signing of declaration in <u>Estate</u> case.	.10 hrs.
06/28/83	Preparation of declaration for contempt proceedings in <u>Estate</u> case.	1.00 hrs.
08/18/83	Letter to Court Clerk requesting certified copies of Hubbard Declaration. (Estate case)	.20 hrs.
04/04/83	Telephone call from John McNamara requesting Afficavit re letter we received from Heller on L. Ron Hubbard. (Omaha case)	.30 hrs.
04/05/83	Preparation of Affidavit for case in Omaha, Nebraska, re Flynn referral. Letter to Mr. McNamara enclosing Affidavit. (Omaha case)	.40 hrs.
05/20/83	Telephone call from Gary McMurry re interview of Gerry. (Christofferson case)	
05/20/83	Telephone call to Gerry re meeting with Gary McMurry on 5/27 for interview. (Christofferson case)	.20 hrs.

05/20/83	Telephone call to Gary McMurry confirming 5/27 for meeting and interview of Gerry. (Christofferson case)	.20	hre.
05/25/83	Telephone call from Armstrong re confirma- tion of meeting with Gary McMurry. (Christofferson case)	.10	his.
05/26/83	Telephone call from Gary McMurry re cancellation of morning meeting. (Christofferson case)	.20	hrs.
05/27/83	Conference with Gary McMurry and Gerry. (Christofferson case)	3.50	hrs.
06/10/83	Receive and review correspondence from Gary McMurry re client. (Christofferson case)	.10	hrs.
09/02/83	Preparation of Motion to Initiate Discovery. (Christofferson case)	1.00	hrs.
09/02/83	Preparation of Notice of Appearance. (Christofferson case)	.40	hrs.
09/07/83	Telephone call from McMurry's office re Motion to Initiate Discovery. (Christofferson case)	.30	hrs.
09/07/83	Review Motion to Initiate Discovery. (Christofferson case)	.40	hrs.
09/07/83	Telephone call to attorney McMurry in Oregon re Titchbourne Motion; with letter forwarding copy of same. (Christofferson case)	. 25	hrs.
09/23/83	Telephone call to Gary McMurry re Request for Continuance. (Christofferson case)	.20	hrs.
09/27/83	Telephone call to attorney Wade re Proof of Service on Titchbourne. (Christofferson case)	.10	hrs.
09/29/83	Telephone call from Magnuson re Order to Show Cause to continue hearing on Titchbourne. (Christofferson case)	.10	hrs.
09/29/83	Telephone call from attorney service re incorrect Notice as to Motion to Initiate Discovery; prepare, serve and file Amende Notice. (Christofferson case)	.50	hrs.

09/29/83	Telephone call to Mike Magnuson re Order Shortening Time to get continuance on Discovery Motion. (Christofferson case)	. 20	his.
09/29/83	Telephone call to Ron Wade re Order Shortening Time to get continuance. (Christofferson case)	.20	hrs.
09/29/83	Telephone call from Ron Wade re Motion for Discovery. (Christofferson case)	.40	hrs.
09/29/63	Telephone call from Michael Magnuson re Motion for Continuance. (Christofferson case)		hrs.
09/29/83	Telephone call to Judge Savitch re Continuance. (Christofferson case)	.30	hrs.
09/29/83	Telephone call to Magnuson re Continuance. (Christofferson case)	.30	hrs.
09/30/83	Telephone call from Magnuson confirming court appearance. (Christofferson case)	.20	hrs.
09/30/83	Court appearance in Department 85, Los Angeles Superior Court, pursuant to Motion to Continue Motion of Titchbourne to Initiate Discovery. (Christofferson case)	3.50 1	hrs.
10/03/83	Telephone call from attorney service re new date for Motion to Initiate Discovery. (Christofferson case)	.10 h	ns.
10/03/83	Long letter to Ron Wade re Motion to Continue Motion to Initiate Discovery. (Christofferson case)	.50 h	ırs.
10/11/83	Telephone call to Mike Magnuson re Christofferson Motion.	.30 h	rs.
11/01/83	Receive and review letter and Notice of Appearance from Charles Merten. • (Christofferson case)	.20 h	rs.
11/02/83	Telephone call from Ron Wade re hearing on Motion to Initiate Discovery. (Christofferson case)	.40 h	rs.
11/04/83	Court appearance in Department 85, Los Angeles Superior Court, pursuant to Motions to Initiate Discovery.		
	(<u>Christofferson</u> case)	2.50 h	rs.

11/04/83	Telephone call to Ron Wade re outcome on Titchbourne Motion. (Christofferson case)	.30	hrs.
11/04/83	Preparation of memo to file re hearing on Motions to Initiate Discovery. (Christofferson case)	.20	hrs.
03/02/84	Preparation of Motion to Initiate Discovery for Armstrong, Peterson, Garrity, Jefferson, Lockwood and Christofferson.	1.00	hrs.
03/05/84	Review and edit Motion to Initiate Discovery. (Christofferson case)	.30	hrs.
03/06/84	Telephone call to messenger to arrange for hand delivery and filing of our Motion. (Christofferson case)	.30	hrs.
03/06/84	Telephone call to messenger to further arrange delivery and filing of our Motion. (Christofferson case)	.20	hrs.
03/19/84	Telephone call to Ron Wade re continuance of Motions. (Christofferson case)	.10	hrs.
03/19/84	Telephone call to Gerry re continuance of hearing. (Christofferson case)	.30	hrs.
03/19/84	Telephone call to Charles Merten re continuance of hearing. (Christofferson case)	.10	hrs.
03/01/84	Receive and review Motion to Initiate Discovery by Martin <u>Samuels</u> .	.40	hrs.
03/02/84	Telephone call to Clerk to get hearing date for Motion of Oregon attorneys. (Samuels case)	. 20	hrs.
03/02/84	Telephone call to attorney Wade re filing and service of Motion. (Samuels case)	.30	hrs.
03/13/84	Telephone call to Ron Wade re continuance of Motions. (Samuels case)	.10	hrs.
03/19/84	Telephone call to Gerry re continuance of hearing. (Samuels case)	.30	hrs.
03/19/84	Telephone call to Marc Blackman re continuance of hearing. (Samuels case)	.10	hrs.
03/05/84	Telephone call to Walt Logan re case on Pre-Clear files. (Wakefield case)	.30	hrs.
		70	0214

04/12/84 Telephone call from Greene & O'Reilly re copies of Motion to Initiate Discovery.

(Wollersheim case) .20 hrs.

04/12/84 Letter to Greene & O'Reilly forwarding Motion to Initiate. (Wollersheim case) .20 hrs.

C. GOVERNMENT CONTACTS:

09/26/82	Telephone call from Martin Cohen, IPS attorney. (NB: Jim Morrow believes that Cohen was just finishing a brief for filing about the first of October.)	.40	hrs.
05/06/83	Telephone call to Florida Assistant State Attorney re Motion to obtain Armstrong documents.	.20	hrs.
05/06/83	Letter to <u>Assistant State Attorney</u> in Florida, re Preliminary Injunction and Motion to Intervene re documents with enclosures.	.40	hrs.
09/20/83	Telephone call from Ray Emmons re obtaining Scientology materials.	.30	hrs.
09/20/83	Letter to Ray Emmons with enclosures.	.50	hrs.
06/25/84	Telephone call from Rose Zoltek of Attorney General's office in Toronto.	.30	hrs.

D. UNENOWN PERSONS, SQUIRRELS, ETC.:

01/18/64	Telephone call from Tom Koustmer re depo- sition of Armstrong.	.30	t.rs.
06/15/84	Telephone call from <u>Valerie Stansfielo</u> re status.	. 20	hrs.
06/21/84	Receive and review Court's Intended Decision; telephone calls from and telephone calls to numerous individuals re Judgment.	3.00	his.
06/22/84	Numerous telephone calls to and from various individuals re judgment; office conferences.	6.00	hrs.
06/26/84	Telephone call from Brenda Yates re copies of exhibits.	.30	hrs.
06/27/84	Telephone call from individual re case	10	hrs.

E. MISCELLANEOUS NON-BILLABLE ITEMS:

09/10/82 Office conference re use of Lexis for research. .20 hrs.

10/08/82 Long distance call to Mike Flynn re most recent Armstrong declaration. (NB: No case is given and this may well be for the McLeans or another case.

.10 hrs.

RE: INVOLVEMENT BY JOCELYN:

08/05/82	Reviewed documentation provided by Gerry and Jocelyn, and statements of involvement re Scientification.		
	re Screncorogy.	1.00	hrs.
04/19/83	Conference with Jocelyn re Declarations		
	of Gerry and Omar.	.50	hrs.
05/02/04	m-112	-	
05/02/84	Telephone call from Jocelyn re service		
	of Writ.	.20	hrs.
05/17/84	Telephone call from Jocelyn Armstrong.	20	hrs.
		. 20	414 0

CONTACTS WITH AFFILIATED OPPOSITION ATTORNEYS:

01/25/83	Telephone call from Walt Logan re Gerry's deposition in the McLean case.	. 25	hrs.
01/26/83	Telephone call to Walt Logan re deposition of Gerry Armstrong in McLean.		his.
03/31/83	Telephone call to Walt Logan re materials he needs to get Armstrong documents. (McLean)	.10	hrs.
04/12/83	Telephone call from Walt Logan. (McLean)	.40	hrs.
03/05/84	Telephone call to Walt Logan re case on Pre-Clear files. (Wakefield case)	.30	his.
01/27/83	Telephone call from <u>Wilkie Cheong</u> re Armstrong deposition in Estate of L. Ron Hubbard case.	.10	hrs.
04/06/83	Telephone call from Wilkie Cheong requestir Order of Preliminary Injunction and copy of Armstrong deposition in Estate case.		hrs.
04/06/83	Letter to Wilkie Cheong enclosing Order rediscovery of Armstrong documents with explanation of procedure and interpretation of Cole's handwriting. (Estate case)		hrs.
05/05/83	Letter to Wilkie Cheong enclosing Gerry's deposition transcript in Estate of L. Ron Hubbard case.	.20	hrs.
05/10/83	Telephone call from Wilkie Cheong re Armstrong declaration for Estate case.	.30	hrs.
05/11/83	Telephone call to Wilkie Cheong re Armstrong declaration to be filed in Estate case.	.30	hrs.
04/04/83	Telephone call from <u>John McNamara</u> requesting Afficavit re letter we received from Heller on L. Ron Hubbald. (Omaha case)	.30	hrs.
05/20/83	Telephone call from Gary McMurry re interview of Gerry. (Christofferson case)	.30	hrs.
05/20/83	Telephone call to <u>Gary McMurry</u> confirming 5/27 for meeting and interview of Gerry. (Christofferson case)	.20	hrs.
05/26/83	Telephone call from <u>Gary McMurry</u> re cancellation of morning meeting. (Christofferson case)	.20 ł	nrs.
		acoco	

05/27/٤3	Conference with Gary McMurry and Gerry. (Christofferson case)	3.50	his.
06/10/83	Receive and review correspondence from Gary McMurry re client. (Christofferson Case)	.10	his.
09/07/83	Telephone call from McMurry's office re Motion to Initiate Discovery. (Christofferson case)	.30	hrs.
09/07/83	Telephone call to attorney McMurry in Oregon re Titchbourne Motion; with letter forwarding copy of same. (Christofferson case)	. 25	his.
09/23/83	Telephone call to <u>Gary McMurry</u> re Request for Continuance. (Christofferson case)	.20	hrs.
06/25/84	Letter to Gary McMurry re Intended Decision.	.30	hrs.
08/03/83	Telephone call to Paul Morantz re Armstrong case.		hrs.
09/27/83	Telephone call to attorney Wade re Proof of Service on Titchbourne. (Christofferson case)	.10	hrs.
09/29/83	Telephone call to Ron Wade re Order Shortening Time to get continuance. (Christofferson case)	.20	hrs.
09/29/83	Telephone call from Ron Wade re Motion for Discovery. (Christofferson case)	.40	hrs.
10/03/83	Long letter to Ron Wade re Motion to Continue Motion to Initiate Discovery. (Christofferson case)	.50	hrs.
11/02/83	Telephone call from Ron Wade re hearing on Motion to Initiate Discovery. (Christofferson case)	.40	hrs.
11/04/83	Telephone call to Ron Wade re outcome on Titchbourne Motion. (Christofferson case)	.30	hrs.
03/02/84	Telephone call to attorney <u>Wade</u> re filing and service of Motion. (Samuels case)	.30	hrs.
03/19/84	Telephone call to Ron Wade re continuance of Motions. (Samuels case)	.10	hrs.

04/12/84 Telephone call from Greene & O'Reilly re copies of Motion to Initiate Discovery.
(Wollersheim case) .20 hrs.

04/12/84 Letter to Greene & O'Reilly forwarding Motion to Initiate. (Wollersheim case) .20 hrs.

RE: WITNESSES:

04/12/83	Telephone call from Gerry re status of Opposition to Motion; getting declarations from Omar and Sullivan.	.20	hrs.
04/28/83	Telephone call from <u>Laurel Sullivan</u> re Armstrong case.	1.00	hrs.
04/28/83	Telephone call to Flynn re Laurel Sullivan.	.60	hrs.
05/02/83	Telephone call to Gerry re Plaintiffs' case; re conversation with Laurel Sullivan.	.40	hrs.
04/26/84	Conference with <u>Sullivan</u> , Flynn and Armstrong re Sullivan deposition.	1.00	hrs.
04/27/84	Telephone call to Laurel Sullivan.	.50	hrs.

The Commonwealth of Wassachusetts

Secretary of the Commonwealth
STATE HOUSE
BOSTON, MASS. 02120

ARTICLES OF ORGANIZATION

(Voder G.L. Ch. 156B)

Incorporators

NAME

POST OFFICE ADDRESS

Include given name in full in case of natural persons; in case of a corporation, give state of incorporation.

Kevin Mark Flynn 12 Union Wharf Boston, Massachusetts

Cheryl Flynn 12 Union Wharf Boston, Massachusetts

Michael J. Flynn . 12 Union Wharf Boston, Massachusetts

The above-named incorporator(s) do hereby associate (themselves) with the intention of forming a corporation under the provisions of General Laws, Chapter 156B and hereby state(s):

1. The name by which the corporation shall be known is:

Flynn Associates Management Corporation

- 2. The purposes for which the corporation is formed are as follows:
- l. To carry on and entertain any business, undertaking, transaction, or operation commonly carried on or undertaken by capitalists, promoters, financiers, contractors, merchants, commission men, and agents, and in the course of such business to draw, accept, indorse, acquire, and sell all or any negotiable or transferable instruments and securities, including debentures, bonds, noter and bills of exchange.
- 2. To issue on commission, subscribe for, acquire, hold, sell, exchange, and deal in shares, stocks, bonds, obligations, or securities of any public or private corporation, government, or municipality, and to hold, purchase or otherwise dispose of shares of the capital stock, bonds, debentures, or other evidences of indebtedness created by any other corporation or corporations, and while the owner thereof to exercise all the rights and privileges of ownership, including the right to vote thereon.

(continued on page 2A)

80-241031

NOTE: If provisions for which the space provided under Articles 2, 4, 5 and 6 is not sufficient additions should be set out on continuation sheets to be numbered 2A, 2B, etc. Indicate under each Article where the provision is set out. Continuation sheets shall be on \$1/2" x 11" paper and must have a left-hand margin 1 inch wide for binding. Only one side should be used.

- 3. To form, promote, and assist financially or otherwise, companies, syndicates, partnerships, and associations of all kinds, and to give any guaranty in connection therewith or otherwise for the payment of money, or for the performance of any obligations or undertaking.
- 4. To acquire, improve, manage, work, develop, exercise all rights in respect of, lease, mortgage, sell, dispose of, turn to account, and otherwise deal with property of all kinds, and in particular business concerns and undertakings.

.3. The total number of shares and the par value, if any, of each class of stock which the corporation is authorized is as follows:

CLASS OF STOCK	MITHOUT PAR VALUE	· mr	TH PAR VALUE		
GAS OF STOCK	NUMBER OF BHARES	NAMES OF BHARES	PAR	AMOUNT	
Preferred					
		> ** ** *** **** ***** ***** **** ****	•	•	
Common	100	•••••••••••••		**************	

4	If more than one class is authorized, a description of each of the different classes of stock with, if any, the pre- ferences, voting powers, qualifications, special or relative rights or privileges as to each class thereof and any series now established:
---	---

None.

*S. The restrictions, if any, imposed by the Articles of Organization upon the transfer of shares of stock of any class are as follows:

None.

The Other lawful provisions, if any for the conduct and regulation of the business and affairs of the corporation, for its voluntary dissolution, or for limiting, defining, or regulating the powers of the corporation, or of its directors or stockholders, or of any class of stockholders.

None.

- 7. By laws of the conjunction have been duly adopted and the initial directors, president, treasurer, and check, whose names are not out below, have been duly elected.
- The effective date of organization of the corporation shall be the date of filing with the Secretary of the .Commonwealth or if later date is desired, specify date, (not more than 30 days after date of filing.)
- 9. The following information shall not for any purpose he treated as a permanent part of the Articles of Organization of the respurstion.
 - a. The post office address of the initial principal office of the corporation in Massachusetts is:

12 Union Wherf Boston Mass

b. The name, residence and post office address of each of the initial directors and following officers of the corporation are as follows:

NAME

RESIDENCE

POST OFFICE ADDRESS

President: Kevin M. Flynn 12 Union Wharf Boston, Massachusetts

Vice President: Cheryl Flynn 12 Union Wharf Boston, Massachusetts

Treasurer: Kevin M. Flynn 12 Union Wharf Boston, Massachusetts

Clerk: Michael J. Flynn 12 Union Wharf Boston, Massachusetts

Directors:

Kevin M. Flynn Cheryl Flynn Michael J. Flynn

- e. The date initially adopted on which the corporation's facal year ends is:

 December 31
- d. The date initially fixed in the by-laws for the annual meeting of stockholders of the corporation is:

 January 30
- e. The name and business address of the resident agent, if any. of the corporation is:

IN WITNESS WIFEREUF and under the penalties of projury the above-named INCORPORATOR(S)

nign(s) these Articles of Organization this

700227

Charles Fland

The signature of each incorporator which is not a natural person must be by an individual who shall show the capority in which he acts and by signing shall represent under the penalties of perjury that he is duly a authorized on its behalf to sign these Articles of Organization.

1.1

SECRETARY OF-

THE COMMONWEALTH OF MASSACHUSETTS

ED 115 27 PH 3 50

CARDRATION DIVISIAN

ARTICLES OF ORGANIZATION
GENERAL LAWS, CHAPTER 156B, SECTION 12

MICHIEL COPY ATTEST

I hereby certify that, upon an examination of the within-written articles of organization, duly submitted to me, it appears that the provisions of the General Laws relative to the organization of corporations have been complied with, and I hereby approve said articles; and the filing fee in the amount of \$ /25 having been paid, said articles are deemed to have been filed with me this

luguet 1980.

Effective date

Michael OSEPH CONNOLLY

Secretary of the Commonwealth

TO BE FILLED IN BY CORPORATION
PHOTO COPY OF ARTICLES OF ORGANIZATION TO BE SENT

Striful & Elygn
13 Unity Heart
Boston Mass 1 02119

FILING FEE: 1/20 of 1% of the total amount of the authorized capital stock with par value, and one cent a share for all authorized shares without par value, but not less than \$125.00 General Laws, Chapter 156B. Shares of stock with a par value of less than one dollar shall be deemed to have par value of one dollar per share.

700228

Copy Mailed SEP 1 1 1980

FLYNN ASSOCIATES MANAGEMENT CORPORATION

CLASS ACTION CASE DEVELOPMENT PROGRAM

TABLE OF CONTENTS

ABOUT THIS PROPOSAL.

I. INTRODUCTION BY ATTORNEY MICHAEL J. FLYNN

II. PRESENT CASES

III. PRESENT CLIENTS - CASES TO BE FILED

IV. MAY CONFERENCE

V. SCIENTOLOGY LOSS OF INCOME

VI. CONSERVATIVE COST OF DEFENDING A PROTOTYPE CASE

VII. SUMMARY

VIII. INVESTORS PROSPECTUS TO PURCHASE SHARES IN FLYNN ASSOCIATES MANAGEMENT CORPORATION

1. DESCRIPTION

2. THE PROBLEM IN CLEARWATER

3. THE PROPOSAL

TABLE A - EXPENSE SCHEDULE TABLE B - BALANCE SKEET TABLE C - REVENUE MODELS

IX. CONTRACT

MAY 12-20 (81)

PACK

PACK

PAMCO DOCS)

ABOUT THIS PROPOSAL ...

1)

THE FOLLOWING PROPOSAL WAS PREPARED OR THE LAW FIRM OF MICHAEL FLYND BY FLYND ASSOCIATES MANAGENER CORPORATION. (FAM.CO)

TOTAL.

FINALLY, FLYNN FLYNDER AT TON (THERED)

THE ON GENILLA COPABLATION

OF LAWYLNI FHROUGH OUT THE

U.S. AND PREHAMED A SYSTEM

OF TURN NEY LAWSUFF IN

STAPTEGE GEOGRAPHIC PREAS.

DISCUSSION OF THIS IS INCCURED

WITHIN THE MOTOSAL UNDER ...

THE SRUTION ENT-TEED MAY...

'CONFLIENCE. THE MAY CONFINE

IS. A MELTING OF THE MAY CONFINE

IS. A MELTING OF STAPTAGY...

SE TEN TOZOGY STAPTAGY...

1662

TNUEST ENT MOSPECTUS TO

TLYMA TOLMENT COAL.

MESCRIFTION: FIRE 13 A

MANGER MENTERS TO STREET TO

MAN POR AND IN LA TO STREET TO

MAN POR AND ONLA SER OPERATE

AND STRATEGY OF ALL SCREWILLOWY

LITICATION OF MICHAEL FLYON &

PAR A CAOLPER CONTERS CONTERS

WITHER REMARKS SCILLIONS

DERIFF OF FIRER SCILLIONS

LITICATION PROSING PERCONT

THE CHUNCHSON SCORN TOLEY

NATION WIRK

IN FORMAINDE.

RISOLIATES,

WINCOLD COS CONTRACT WELL

MICHARL FCONDA PSOCIATION FRE

INCLUPES JONG OF CATION FRE

DEVELOP MENT; OF

CLIENTS, WARRAS, MARIES OF

METC, HERE CONTRETED MICHARL

METC, HERE CONTRETED MICHARL

METCHAR PROCEDIES FOR MILE AND

METCHARL FLYNN, INCHARL

METCHARL FLYNN MISCORPES

MENDER MICHARL FLYNN MISCORPES

MANDER MICHARL FLYNN MISCORPES

MANDER MICHARL FLYNN MISCORPES

METOLOGY 21 TO FROM MICO

ABMINISTATES THIS INFLOW AND

0-3 FLOW OF PROME FOR

@ PLANNING

HIS FORY -AT. THE INCLITION of SCIR-TULOGY LITIGATION, ... TICITARL FLYNN AND ASSOCIATE LANTRAS HAD ONK LANSUIT REA, NST TAZ CHUNCH OZ SCIEN-TOLOGY. ALTERNA WHEN FICKO, TITE ALPIA licale ul on WHE IN A BARAF DRAC OF LOLAL MEDIA ATTRANTION. THE LOCAL CHURCH OF SCIENTOLOGY INTROIATRES MESTON DEO, W tracis dutan ATONY STATZMANT AND FILING BOARD OF DAR URASRIA CONSLAINTS MICHARL PLYAM, THE RUBERTY chused news BIBASTACTED BLIRATOLOGUT TO COPER FORESAD FOR ATTORNEYS FLYN. Tith new of the 62~2 xortho ··FLYnn OFFICE OLUMN HANGLING THE SEDI mATRACAL, KND BOCUMENTS WIS BESILLED

Conve

KISTONY. ELENSUM WEAL ON BEHAUF OF EXSCR. TO COST/ DE VEIT, - STRUFFICALLY TO ASOPULE THE LAW SUIT EXPRITED LILIBETEN the court was proceeded of LALLYER KELATIVE VALUE PUSESED USING FETT / KEU1018 FITTONEK SLTILLARNI OR VRRAIET HIS TORY, AND THE LUE AND ALPUMPAICIPP of REFS. CHURCH ASSESTS. 188.0_ FACO ALC....THE LLENZANI LITE CATION. AND HUNT WORTH POOKS SLTTLE ARAT LAD VLLDICT) MURAT AND FUTURA .CASK CORPOS,

700233

EXHIBIT C . 8/

THE MEDIA GOT WWD DT

THURSE AND ICADIA TO RIZING

FROM SING CON STORE AND SECONDER

THE SCIENTO CONSOLST. SEAN CHANDER

FROM F TAR CANYOUND END THE

MEDIA, END EXECTION 14

PISKUSTING THE CAN YEAR OF THE

OBYLCTURY AND SOM WITHERON.

OF THEIR LAW SUITS

WEUALUATION .. F. REACHADIL KESETS IN ALLOSSEE THE MAJOR FOR LO GRAPHIC COESTIONS WHARK LAUSURES ARK FILKO,. AND ON ALYSIS... OF THE OFFICE 65 CONCRANING "UHRAL DO (TAXLENTED WE GO FROM HEAR! AND FINELLY UNDER TIPE HEROING OF PANNING, PAMO, thoras, Inchance & FINANCIAL COST PROFICE OPEN TO THE LAWRENT RON CRAMING WHICK DINKCTION TO INOCKAD.

THE PRODUCTION CLEARAPLE

SINCK 1876. CAR COPY... OF CLRAR WATER, FLORIDA HAS DERN DESET WITH THE PRO-OLL ~ OF HORSE HAVENE THR SCIRNTOLOGY CULT STORES Fire office IN FILTRATIONS THE FADRIC OF THE CONNUNTY. The Thirt TRUUNK FEE THE CONNUNTY. ESTAL CALATRO EXTARAL ILL FERCING, AS OVER THE YEARS THE EXTENT MAN PUDLISHED MANY STONIKY OF SURNICLOGY ACTIVETIAS IN CCERA WATER. WRITTETS Black SE GU A NESULT OF nelia ATTRATION THE CITY HAS AZLRIVAD A DIFICK REK" JOKES, LESSENING THERESON-ABELETY OR NEW TAX PAYRAS_ FAR BUSINESSI TO LOCATE THEM. SCILLTOLOGY INOTHATE IN CLRANLATRA INOIRA. WEEK. ON UKL BELLARSS BUS WASS AND RAAC ... RETATE VALVES PLUCTIONS A DYENG DOWN TOWN. FORESCH

WHY YHIS HALLENS IS BE INOUN BY COOKING ATA SMICAR EXPERIENCE ON FUE IN KOLLY WOUR CALLEDANIA. FIR SCIRNIOLOGY coultry SCIRNIOLOGY LUNCHASED NUMBEROF BURLELLES HOLLE wood in THE SIATKI ANG RANCE SEURNTYS. FOR RA-CONVERTED THEM TO TO HOUSE AND TRIEN SCIENTO COGIST. DES SCIRNTOLOGIST WAS ON THE WOOLR PLAKET MOST ON ALLOK THEIR INCOME TO THE SCIRNTOLOGY MEDICATION AS A NESULT THESE SCIENTOLDGG. HAUR · LIFTER OR NO INCOME TO DISPENCE BUSINASS COMMUNITY, ON WELFARE IN ORSER UIVE ... HERRIN. LIKS THR .. OF THE PROBLEM, AS MONE SEIKNPOLOGIST MOVE with THE. ANEA THE SCHOTOLOGY ONBANIZATION PUNCHAJES in 6 RLAC BITATE PROPULTIVE. REUUNUL PROFUCKAS OUTTO MORR AFFLURATE WAENE MONRY STICE Bliwarn... Phored for

A LOOK AT. HOLLEWOOD TODAY VENUS THEATE. YEARS_460 STANKE TWENTS YRAS. AGO. HOLLE WOOD. CALIFORNIA WAS TOTA HOME of middle and with. CCMS CITICAN ... TO DAY 17 1895 BELLN TARN FORMED NOTE A WACFALL COMMUNITY, THE UKCFAAR OA LOW. IN COME. NON SCIKNTOLOGIST MIUR NON MOURD INTO THE ANER AS A LESULT OF DEIRNING MILL RITATE VALUES. IT EXIRCIAO INCRANA IN CRIONE KATE FOLLOWED SWIFFLY. INTERRITINGLY, SCIENTOCOGY MOULE IN GUILTLY WITH MOST. IRASONS MOT KNOWING who title were on Becievens THRY WARR A CHURCH, AS. MOST PROPER UNBRASTAND A CHURCH TO DX -JANUARLLY, 17 WOULD BL BIFFIC URT TO PROJECT. 1. Smill Good Schunder OCUARNO IN CCEARLATER, DUT. CILATFINIE ALL THE KAY in call chair ALL Tirank THE THE CENTRAL HOLLER LIES. NOT IN PLONE LAKENG SCIRNTOLOGY BUT

HOW SCORNTOCOGY. CAN. FENTEN A OLTENIONATION CONMUNITY. ANOUND CT. LNURING DOTING KARKET OLEURS AS BUSINESS AND TAX BAREAL LEAUL THE ANLA DOR EFFICIENTE FARURATIN NEW ONK . 1.20THE PROJOSAL

POTE: FLYNN MISOL MENT COPP.

HES SUPPLEMENTING THIS.

PROPOREL WITH THE.

CLASS ACTION. DEVELOPMENT

PROGRAM FOR TIME TO TIME.

THE STALL -THE PURPOSE OF THIS PROPOSAL the state of the IS THE OFFRANCES SHANES IN FLYON WISOCIATED OR GOT EONIL FOR SELR. FLYAN AUS OLM TES rbat cont. is. A newfolkmant CONSULTING. FIRM. WHILE ASSOCIATE LAWYEN THE IT . IROJORS ... THE SZAVILL . EN CONSIS BISCUSSROWN. THE DESCRIPTION SLCTION. OF. JHIS 120 POSAL. MICHALL FLY -- AND AUSOCIATE LEWELL HAS CONTRACTED. WITH Flynn Alsociate nont col. 78 ASSIST IN ONCANCE ON 6 RED PNO CARATING BUT TAK PLULLOSMENT of hatter NEW. LAW SUAS.... TO BE SIERDIN

CLEAR WAFER FLOA 104 BRING 6×00667 ON BEHACK ... I.F. CUIRNIS OF MICHAR FCIN-LIWYRAS, DICEUSA O. R. VANIETE OR CONSTAICTIONS, TAC when LAN KIRA OR WICHARL xlend. AND OTHER MUCHETE LEWYRRS HAS CONTRACTED RLYNN MISOC. MICAT DAGANICE ASTA THU ELULLOPOLNT FBOOK INCCUPE: O BROBALIA SILARATION OF BOTH CLIRA AND LAW YRAS FROM RACK wall As Elon Elucation, Attitude Ano 60126 LEGAL AISISPANCE course to C (LERWETER IN CCUPES DAASME is, climis. FROM HUDDARDS SON TO OFFICE (TAL FIRE DIFECTORS, L'EGIA MI - ONANDA... CASES FILED / THE LEW SULT), GOURAN MENT AND contACTS., LEGAL COMUETING fre shiller, E.TC.

THE

WITH PROPER ADMINISTAPTION MICHAEC MUPLI TO BRING ON BECKALK ... OF AGRICURA KON- AR SCHLOSO. FURACES OF CAUSUASI CCRAR WATER FLORISH, THE. LPN DU 175 IN QUESTION BAK EKSCAIDED IN THE COMS ACTAL OKURCOINANT INO GRANIN FEG SKUTION ZTITLE PRAJENT THE PARSENT WOATH CF THRIL CASRS 6,412,600 JUST FIEZ MONEY LOUT TO A. HIGH OF 21, 104, 904 WHICH REPRAIRWI MERAN ATK INKSRNTLY. . TAL .. LX /KAIKACE SUDJECT TO ENALYSIS_IS THE SULIR TICH BOUR ME CHRISTOFFENSON CAIR IN PURTLAND, DREGON. THIS CAIR. WAS DROUGHT SCIL- TOLOGUET. DE. THE LAW FIRM OF MENINY ON DEHALF OF SUCIR CHAIS TOFFERROW ... TIS CHAIS TOFFRNON WAS IN SCIR-TOLOGY FOR A. ILAND. OR Aflaox ingTLEY work now TAS one last just oura 3.000.

for A-EAR C

M'AULAY TRILE THE WAL RED IN THE KARLY 1928 TO BUY CLEAR GA ALBIA NOTONIKIE, OF THE OFFICES. ACHUM DIRRPTRE SOLKLY ON INFORMATIO. PROJURA TO MION DE NOS CCIRAT, ns CHRISTOFF RNOW ,... THE ... LIMITED AMOUNT THE JUXT OF INFURRATION THE JULY HLERE OUTRIBLE TALM EN L+TENT THEY AWARDED MS CHRUTOFFRAJON HER 3000 BACK AND 2 1100,000 12 PUN ITEM SAMPLES. EWE VIEW HIS AS AN LITERAR ANOVA AND HAVE TEKEN A MUCH MURR MODERATE POSTURA. IN 25 TIME THE HIBA CANGE OF THRSA CERARWOTH DATERTOOKE, JAL. CHUCRH ,~ PONTERNO APPEALLE THE CASE OUT INTERESTINGLY ._ .. THE CHURCH IUT. UI THE \$ 2,000,000 IN CASH AND TO SATINFE THE CCAM. JALLENES ARE. WALL HORROR AILS COMPARED TO THE HANTO PRASON. CASR

ADDITIONALLY, DOLUMENTS, wit wasks and founde neadly 1200166 FAR GERATER INCHO THEN THE CIMITED RESOURSES... FULLLADER. TOA ME COLVERT FIRM. HATER THAT HED. THAKE YEARS CATER . THE COUNTRY AND CENTERNLY THE COME CLARAWRIER WHITE PROUGER A HENTICK ENVIRONMENT FOR THE JCIEN-70606157 TO DEFEND & CANJUST. IN OLORA TO RETURN THE DEVILERMENT FROEKEN M CLLAR LATER, FCIAN ANOC. nint. CORP REQUIRES FILL FILANCING, THERES NECRSSHAY 70 EXPENS, A EXPANSION STO SLAUNCES TO LAWYERS IN
SIMILARIO

SIMILARIO

DESCHORD LAKLIER FIRENCIAG WOULD PROVIDE THE NECRISTARY WORKS-6 CASITOL FOR THE TO TAKE MACE. E. AN OFFRAING IS THENRESOM APR TO SELC AN APPROPRIATE OF SHANES. TO RAISE & 110,000.

700244

EXHIBIT C

.92

0

THE 190,000 WICC COURNRETAINES FOR AN 18-18 MONTH

PLATOR THE THE EXPLANANT

WHO RE PROPERTIES AFFERME, LTG,

LAWYERS AND OTHER ASSOCIATED

REFERENCE, THE 180,000 FOUNCE

REFERENCE OR APPEARED FOR ETHE

REFERENCE OR APPEARED FOR ETHE

REFERENCE OR APPEARED FOR THE

PROD SIJOCIATE LAWYERS LETTERATION

IN UHICH 232,000 WAS EXPENDED

THIS IN THE 180 SOFT

VERR INCURRED AT A REJUCT

OF LITTLEFORM OURR & BROAD

GEO GASTHER LARRES WITH THE

COSPY. RESOCIATED WITH THE

LITTLEFORM,

6 SHART END NO.Z.

ENTINATION 21.6% of THE CONTANT WIS OFFERNO FOR SECR, WIS A 21.6% MOFRE OUNERSHIP PRODUCER & A 250 ACTURN FOR RACH 1.00 INVESTED

REVULL ASSEDS OF FLIAM ASSOCIETES. MANAGEMENT CORPORATION FAR PO THR FOLLOwing: For 22000 CASH ON HAND.

Ricy CUTED RIUSUSE

130,000 ACCOUNTS ACCRIVEDCE 2 40,000 FUTURE ACCOUNT PLC. 187,100 INCIDIOUSE COANTEL 0 20,000 25 10 of Projected FLLJ, Comment

THRAR RAK PAEVENTLY NO LIABICITIES,

EQUITS 15 SCESSFUL CONCUSION LOGY CITIGETIONS

BASED ON THE ADOUR PILTS ARE INOJECTED. NEU UNUR SCAROUER 21.6% OF TAK CONTANT IS OFFERED FOR SACR. A 21.8 %. SURPL NOLSKY. PROFICE PROVIDES A ... 2.00 RETURN 121: LACH 1.00 INVESTED. AS. 3 The conclusion was the CANSUITS. SUCRISFULLY CONCLUSED INVIOLNA WILL OS DE DISTUNCO TO SETISFY TIFELL GOODFILM NETURA SCENARIO

TAL ASSETS. 1-0 BRUUNUE. SCHROUR.

THE LOW FO MEDING AFROL

FIGURES FOUND IN THE CLASS

THE CALL TO SHA THE CENS

ACTION PLUZLOPORENT. REGOLAGE

IF VERSICES ON SETTLEMENT

IN THE CLLHAWATER CASES ...

FOLLOWED A MERKASTE TO ETTA.

wo would ph with

3,384,000 providing A SHARE.

HOLDER ALTURN OF 4.00 FORE

LACH 1.00 INVESTED.

DOWN SIAR KISK

A IN ANY NUK

ULNTURE THE OFFICIATION TY

FOR THE INVENTOR TO

LOSE ALL HIS OR HER MONEY

EXISTS. THE QUESTION IS

WHET IS THE PRODUBLETTY, THAT

WILL OLCUR, EX EXECUTED TO

FRENCHES OF NECESTARY TO

REGION AT THIS INDO ADICITY.

BYLLS FLA IN 6641. TO

REVIEW EXPERTED TO

REVIEW EXPERTED TO

REVIEW FRANK FOR LIVINGON MENT.

AFFIDAVIT .

STATE OF FLORIDA COUNTY OF PINELLAS

Jim Grey, having first been duly sworn, hereby deposes and says:

- 1. I am a resident of Clearwater, Plorida.
- 2. On October 2, 1981, I received a visit at my office from Jay Keyes, Michael Plynn, and two other people. Beverly Hyde, my secretary was in the room during the visit, and witnessed it.
- 3. Jay Keyes made the introductions and told me that because I was courageous and outspoken and had once publically said that "the place to handle Scientology is in the court:", he thought I would be interested in what Michael Plynn and his associates had to propose.
- 4. Michael Flynn then offered me the position of Trunter of Flynn Associate Management Corporation (PAMCO) in the Clearwater area and told me that as a Trustee, I would receive, raise and disburse monies which would be used to file suits against the Church of Scientology around the country and therefore break the Church rinancially.
- 5. I told Michael Flynn that I would most surely be anking to be sued if I accepted that, to which the latter said that it was likely that I was correct, but then that in what the money was for.
- they would have to disassociate themselves from Richard Tenney publically as it would have to be connected with him.
- 7. Although there were no outright statements ander to me to the effect that I would make any money out of this, it was however distinctly clear to me that Michael Plynn and others were soliciting money for their suits.
- 8. When I pointed to Mr. Flynn and his associates that : had no desire to be a guinea pig for his lawsuits and take part in an operation which, in my judgment, could be EXHIBIT D

in violation of Constitutional rights, Mr. Plynn became agitated, whereupon he asked me how I would like it if my daughter got mixed up with Scientology and shot herself in the head. I asked Michael Plynn, if my daughter had gone into the Baptist Church and shot herself, did that mean that the Baptist Church was responsible, and Michael Plynn walked out in disgust.

The above is a true and correct statement to the best of my recollection.

Jim Grey

Subscribed and sworn to before me this 13th day of October 1981.

Notary Public

Motory Public, State of Florida at Lurgo My Commission Lupica April 2, 1984

Tamimi affidavit omitted as it is included as an exhibit in the Miller v. Flynn Motion to Strike Affidavit of Kevin Flynn filed July 23, 1984.

J

G

GEORGE EDGERLY declares as follows:

I am presently incarcerated at Massachusetts Correctional Institution in Bridgewater serving a sentence for murder under case number 81811, Commonwealth v. Edgerly.

I was first introduced to attorney Michael J. Flynn in late 1975 or the first two months of 1976. He was introduced to me by Theodore Kemos as the lawyer for Kemos.

I was the defendant in a criminal case for fraud. Trial began in Lowell, Massachusetts in February, 1976. Attorney Flynn attended the trial almost every day. I was free on bail, and generally had lunch at a sandwich shop on Gorham Street. In March, 1976, during lunch break, I was approached by Flynn. He requested that I go with him over to a corner of the sandwich shop out of earshot of others, which I dig.

Flynn asked me if I had been offered a deal. I told him that Lt. Peter Agnus had talked to me, but no deal had been directly offered, and that the Assistant District Attorney Danny O'Connell had offered a deal through my lawyers. The deal offered was that if I would testify against Theodore Kemos and R. Gordon Butler, I would get eighteen months in prison and another eighteen months probation. I told Flynn I had refused this deal.

Flynn then asked me if I was going to testify in my own defense, and I told him that I didn't intend to at this time. He then told me that I would probably be convicted and do time. He said that if I didn't testify in my own defense, they would give my wife Linda five hundred dollars a week for every week I

ess. audi Lumi

La corre Eller Ca

spent in prison.

1

2

7

8

10

13

14

15!

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

261

Flynn also warned me that if I did testify, the judge would allow the prosecutor to bring in the pending murder charge or ask me questions about it which would affect my credibility. I told Flynn that I agreed with him, and would not testify, and that I accepted their offer.

About four days before the end of the trial, I began thinking that I could win the case if I testified. I communicated this to one of my lawyers, Patrick J. Piscatelli. Piscatelli tolo me that I could not testify because of the deal I had made not to 11 testify. Later the same day, Flynn asked me to meet him 12 downstairs from the courtroom.

When I met with Flynn, he reminded me of the conversation he and I had in the sandwich shop about two weeks before, and asked if I could use some money. I replied that I could, and he then surreptitiously handed me ten one hundred dollar bills folded together. He said that this was two weeks at five hundred a week and that I could see that "our word is good." I placed the thousand dollars in a suit pocket in a closet in my home, and later, after I was sentenced, directed my wife to the money.

I did not testify, and was convicted and sentenced to three to five years.

Between October and December, 1976, I was in trial as a defendant on a charge of conspiracy. My codefendants were R. Gordon Butler and Theodore Kemos. Flynn represented Kemos. At the beginning of the trial, Flynn told me that he was also representing Kemos in a big civil case against General Motors. He told me that Butler was also suing General Motors. Flynn said

28

2 3 4

that if they were acquitted, Butler and Kemos would win their civil suits, but if convicted they would definitely lose. He then told me that Butler and Kemos would cut me in on their recovery from General Motors so long as I did not testify. I agreed not to testify.

During the trial, after I had complained to my lawyer about his representation of me, the trial judge found a conflict of interest and removed my lawyer. I wound up representing myself. In that capacity, I was privy to chambers conferences between the attorneys. On one occasion, the judge called us all into chambers and said that a prosecution witness, James Dolson, had spoken with him about what Dolson felt was an attempt by Flynn to intimidate him.

As the judge related it, Dolson tolo him that Flynn had approached Dolson on the back stairs of the courthouse and engaged him in conversation. According to Dolson, Flynn tried to implant in Dolson's mind that Kemos and Butler were not guilty and that only I was guilty. Dolson felt that Flynn was trying to influence Dolson's testimony. The judge said that Dolson claimed that Flynn threatened him and then offered him a reward if he would change his testimony. Flynn told the judge that he had been misunderstood by Dolson and denied any improper behavior. The judge admonished Flynn and made mention of the Bar Overseers.

Because I felt as though Kemos and Butler were making me the fall guy, I began aggressively cross-examining the witnesses in the case. Flynn took me to an adjoining room of the courthouse out of earshot of the guards. Flynn told me that Kemos was angry at me and wanted to know why I was doing this. He tolo me that

w. Iness . and Le wave

-3- (.... c. 29 (.... c)

if I agreed he would feed me cross-examination questions that 2 would help Kemos and Butler. He told me to remember that a lot of money had been put away for me. I told Flynn that all I had were promises. Flynn then said that they would give me eighteen thousand dollars right away. I told Flynn to give my wife the eighteen thousand dollars right then or there was no more deal. Flynn then told me that Butler's lawyers had said not to give the money in a lump sum. Flynn left.

We then met again in the prisoners' room adjoining the courtroom. This time Flynn told me that Butler and Kemos wanted me to back off on my cross-examination. He said that they would be found not guilty, and would not forget what I was doing. He then told me that he knew I was concerned about my family and that I had a lot of children who were little. He said that one of them could be hit by a car, and that anything like that might happen to my children.

I felt very intimidated by this conversation; I tolo Flynn that he had already been admonished by the judge about his conversation with Dolson, and told him that I would tell the judge about this conversation. Flynn told me that the judge would not believe anything I said, and left.

One or two days later, I had a conversation with my wife, Linda. She told me that earlier that day Flynn had approached her in the courtroom. Linda said that Flynn told her that he had noticed she was at the courthouse every day watching the trial. He then told her that while she was at court she had children at home, and inquired of her whether someone was watching them and whether she knew if they were safe. He then told her that I was

700254 -4- 237 Crage Silge.

witness: and Lunuri

1

3

4

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

going against Kemos and Butler and that she should speak to me about this. He ended off by telling her that he hoped someone was watching the children properly because something could happen to them. Thereafter, except for the verdict, Linda did not come back to court.

I reported these threats to the judge in chambers with all of the attorneys present. Flynn denied making any threats to me and told the judge that Linda must have misunderstood him. He claimed he only had a friendly conversation with her about her kids and their welfare. The judge asked Flynn whether he had talked with Linda before the conversation about her children and Flynn said he had not. The judge told me that I did not have to talk with Flynn, and told Flynn not to talk to Linda again.

Kemos, Butler and I were convicted of conspiracy, and sentenced. I never saw Flynn again.

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

Executed this 500 day of March, 1984 at Bridgewater, Massachusetts.

w. tres. and Lunaica

George Eagerly

The foregoing statement and admission was signed in my presence and the person George Edgerly, who signed it declared that he had carefully read it and the contents were thoroughly understood and that each and every one of the statements therein contained are absolutely true.

Andrew J. Palermo
Massachusetts Justice of
The Peace

March \$ 1984

7/83